
 

 

 

 
  

 

REHOBOTH BEACH HOMETOWN CHRISTMAS  PARADE-TUESDAY, 

DECEMBER 2 

The Rehoboth Beach Volunteer Fire Company has provided confirmation that tonight’s 
Christmas Parade is proceeding as planned – the parade starts at 6:30 PM. 
 

REHOBOTH BEACH SEASHORE MARATHON/HALF MARATHON 

The Rehoboth Beach Seashore Marathon and Half Marathon will be held this Saturday, December 6, from 
7 a.m.-2 p.m.  There are 2,600 runners registered and Rehoboth Beach Running Company expects 7,500 
people downtown for this event.  The majority of the runners come into town early 
Friday afternoon.  Following is a brief summary of the events scheduled throughout this week:  Friday, Dec. 
5- Noon to 8pm - Racers pick up their packages in the Cultured Pearl - the restaurant will be open for food 
& drink at Noon.  Saturday, Dec. 6 -7am - the race begins at the Bandstand; 8:15 -the first half marathoners 
finish (Awards at 10:00 in The Cultured Pearl); 9:45 - the first full marathoners finish (Awards at 11:30 in 
The Cultured Pearl); 3:00 - the last runners should be in by 3:00 and the race will end.  By Friday evening, 
Dec. 5, 4th Street and portions of Rehoboth Avenue and Sussex Street will be closed.  In addition, the 
Marathon barricades, tents, time clocks, cameras and the finish line will be set up on 4th Street. 
 

DNREC SEEKS PUBLIC INPUT – OPEN HOUSE THIS EVENING – TUESDAY, DECEMBER 2 

DNREC's Division of Parks and Recreation is proposing increases in certain user fees, and is seeking input 
from the public on the proposed changes.  Delaware State Parks has maintained a high level of public 
service without adjusting fees for the last 10 years.  The Division is seeking input on the proposal through 
public open houses in December – in Sussex County, the open house is scheduled for today, December 2 

from 6:30-8:30 PM at Cape Henlopen State Park Officers Club, 15099 Cape Henlopen Drive, Cape 
Henlopen State Park, Lewes.  The proposed increases, a questionnaire to provide input, and important 
information about the management, improvements and capital upgrades needed to maintain and enhance 
Delaware State Parks, are available beginning today, Dec. 2, 2014 at www.destateparks.com/OpenHouse. 
The public can also call the Division of Parks and Recreation at 302-739-9220.   
 
SLAM DUNK TO THE BEACH – DECEMBER 27-29, 2014 

The State has asked us to provide Slam Dunk sponsorship information to members--sponsorships range 
from $150.00 to several thousand dollars.  For information, contact Jerry duPhily, 302-655-6483, ext. 222 or 
jduphily@tsnpub.com. 
 

JANUARY 2015 ISSUE OF BUSINESS REPORT – SPECIAL OFFER FOR SMALL BUSINESSES 

Get your business noticed by thousands of business owners and professionals – in the January 2015 issue of 
the Morningstar Business Report, along with a 1/6 page ad, you can submit a 200 word article about your 
business for the Special Rate of $150.  For more information, contact Chris Redman – 302-262-9137 or e-
mail credman@mspublications.com. 
 
 

 
 
 

For a complete Calendar of Events, visit the Chamber website - www.beach-fun.com.  If you have 
questions, please give Carol a call on the member hotline- 227-6446, or her cell phone at 542-7547. 
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